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This article examines some of the problems faced by librarians who have both collection 
development and reference responsibilities. Major concerns include balancing demands on 
one's time, unclear supervisory lines, and misunderstanding of the collection development 
process. Suggestions include establishing formal reporting lines for both reference and 
collection development, increasing communication among supervisors, training selectors more 
effectively, and heightening awareness of the necessity for better organization in collection 
development. 

cademic librarianship, like 
many other academic fields, 
seems to be becoming less spe­
cialized, at least in many 

medium- and small-sized libraries. In­
creasingly, librarians face a multiplicity of 
jobs, e.g., reference work, collection de­
velopment, cataloging, and teaching. 
Most literature on library jobs, however, 
tends to present librarians as single-task · 
specialists. In reality, librarians regularly 
perform two or more jobs. The problems 
inherent in trying to juggle multiple re­
sponsibilities are of considerable concern. 
One of the most common arrangements is 
the combining of reference and collection 
development. This dual responsiblity 
usually takes one of two forms: bibliogra­
phers (subject specialists) who also do ref­
erence, or reference librarians who also do 
collection development. Several articles 
have recently focused on dual assign­
ments from the point of view of a collec-

tion development officer. 1 This article 
however, examines reference librarians 
who have selection responsibilities. 

Laurie Linsley, in a paper given at the 
third Association of College and Research 
Libraries (ACRL) conference, lists the ref­
erence/collection development split as the 
most common dual assignment in the 
seventy-two academic libraries she sur­
veyed. A study conducted in 1983 by 
Nancy Emmick and Luella Davis shows 
that 37.9 percent of academic reference li­
brarians also perform collection develop­
ment work, and 70.3 percent have liaison 
assignments with faculty. A 1983 survey 
by the Discussion Group on Reference 
Services in Large Research Libraries 
shows that two-thirds of the reporting ref­
erence departments had librarians with 
substantial collection development du­
ties. A 1987 article on training new refer­
ence librarians reports that these people 
spent about 12 percent of their time on col-
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lection development activities. 2 Obvi­
ously, many reference librarians also have 
collection development duties, and from 
the recent interest in this topic, perhaps 
best exemplified by the newly formed Col­
lection Development and Evaluation Sec­
tion (CODES) within the Reference and 
Adult Services Division (RASD), many li­
brarians are experiencing the pressures of 
handling more than one responsibility. 

Having one person do several jobs in the 
lihrary is not necessarily dysfunctional. In 
the last several years there has been a 
good deal of discussion about an inte­
grated model of academic librarianship, 
particularly in medium- and small-sized li­
braries. In such a model"subject special­
ists or scholar librarians do collection de­
velopment and provide in-depth 
reference service including bibliographic 
instruction and online searching in their 
fields of expertise. ''3 While many librari­
ans find the integrated approach appeal­
ing, Patricia Swanson points out that 
"there is a contradiction in the integrated 
model in that on the one hand, we are ex­
pected to do everything and on the other 
hand quality work environments are sup­
posed to identify and nurture our individ­
ual talents and strengths. " 4 In other 
words, although all of us do not do every­
thing equally well, and probably do not 
want to, we often are expected to do so, 
and we are evaluated as though we do. 

This problem is compounded in the ref­
erence and collection development split 
by the fact that reference has a long and 
fairly stable tradition. Reference librarians 
know what they are expected to do and 
how to do it. This is not the case for collec­
tion development. Not long ago, the trend 
in collection development was toward 
subject bibliographers, but today that 
structure is not as prevalent. Indeed, as a 
recent article by Jeanne Sohn points out, 
there is no clear pattern of how collection 
development is organized in Association 
of Research Libraries (ARL) libraries. Not 
only is there no clear pattern, but almost 
half of the collection development officers 
who responded to Sohn' s survey were 
dissatisfied with the way collection devel­
opment was handled in their institu­
tions-even if that structure had changed 
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recently.5 One can argue, and many peo­
ple have, for or against full-time bibliogra­
phers as opposed to part-time selectors, 
but the reality is that man1librariaris have 
multiple responsibilities. 

There are several problems inherent in 
attempting to handle multiple responsibil­
ities in a library or any other type of work­
place. One of the most significant and dif­
ficult is managing all of the demands on 
one's time. Most reference librarians work 
at a reference desk, perform online litera­
ture searches, give library instruction ses­
sions, and prepare handouts or bibliogra­
phies. In addition to these responsibili­
ties, one might find such other duties as 
collection development, interlibrary loan, 
and government publications. 7 

What almost always happens in such 
situations is that when push comes to 
shove, collection development gets 
shoved. Collection development rarely 
has the immediacy of reference work. One 
can always order a book tomorrow or next 
week, but one cannot always put off a 
tour, or an online search, or one's regu­
larly scheduled hours on the reference 
desk. A 1979 study of public services li­
brarians conducted at Brigham Young 
University shows that "few generaliza­
tions can be made except that all four 
types of [public service] librarians spend 
less time on acquisitions than on refer­
ence."8 

The other major problem is supervision. 
Usually a reference librarian who also 
does collection development reports to a 
head of reference. Rarely does a reference 
librarian report to a collection develop­
ment officer. Sohn' s article points out that 
this is a major problem for collection de­
velopment officers without official super­
visory authority who must coordinate the 
work of many part-time selectors. 9 Some 
librarians are fortunate enough to report 
formally to a head of reference for refer­
ence duties and to a collection develop­
ment officer for selection responsibilities, 
but that administrative pattern is not prev­
alent. 

Formal reporting lines for collection de­
velopment, however, can help to legiti­
mize selection and allow selectors whose 
primary assignment is elsewhere to feel 
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more secure about the time that they de­
vote to collection development. Such re­
porting may also help librarians with se­
lection and reference responsibilities to be 
relieved of some reference duties if they 
can show that they officially are doing col­
lection development. Similarly, clearly 
defined reporting lines may help with 
matters such as access to support staff. 
Anyone who does collection development 
knows that much clerical work is needed. 
Reporting to a collection development of­
ficer may make it easier to get support staff 
outside of the reference department to 
help with such tasks. 

Formal reporting lines and job descrip­
tions allow librarians with selection and 
reference responsibilities to know which 
criteria they are being evaluated on and 
what they must do to meet their supervi­
sors' expectations. Such reporting also 
helps assure the selector of more input 
into decision and policy making. This is 
especially important when one person is 
reporting to, and being evaluated by, two 
or more supervisors. Clearly, the head of 
reference and the collection development 
officer must know each other's goals and 
objectives. They need to check for comple­
mentary or opposing goals and objectives, 
and they should attempt to see whether a 
librarian doing both reference and collec­
tion development is able to meet all of the 
stated objectives. Similarly, selectors who 
are primarily reference librarians, and do 
not report to a collection development of­
ficer, should somehow be involved in 
goals and objectives planning for collec­
tion development. 

There also has to be good communica­
tion and coordination at the higher levels 
of administration, either department head 
or assistant/ associate dean level. A prob­
lem with collection development is that, 
on the one hand, it is becoming more visi­
ble, often through promotion of a person 
to an assistant/ associate dean in charge of 
collection development; while on the 
other hand, this person often has little au­
thority or line responsibility. 10 This may be 
due to an unwillingness of traditional li­
brary administrations to change. In order 
for a person to be made an associate/ assis­
tant dean for collection development and 
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given line responsibility for selectors, 
someone else in the organizational struc­
ture must relinquish some authority and 
power. Administrators may need to think 
more about how their roles affect those be­
low them and the library as a whole and 
not so much about their own power ba­
ses.11 

One potential way of handling multiple 
reporting lines is through matrix manage­
ment. Indeed, according to one article, 
"the dominant characteristic of matrix 
structure . . . is the dual reporting rela­
tionship."12 There are several difficulties 
with a matrix structure, however, includ­
ing a tendency to defer making decisions, 
and a danger of power struggles among 
multiple bosses trying to gain control of li­
brary units. David W. Lewis has sug­
gested an organizational paradigm using a 
modified professional bureaucracy in 
which middle management is reduced 
and a large support staff is provided to 
free professionals from routine tasks. This 
structure might allow greater freedom for 
a librarian to do more than one job.13 

In addition to clear reporting lines, the 
mention of collection development duties 
in a librarian's job description and assign­
ment of a percentage of a person's time or 
work load to collection development may 
be a good idea. Not that one should feel 
compelled to follow slavishly the percent­
age named, but once again a clearly de­
fined amount of time devoted to collection 

· development allows a selector to feel bet­
ter able to give that time to collection de­
velopment. An assigned amount of time 
might also lead administrators to realize 
that a person is officially doing collection 
development, and, just as importantly, it 
may help part-time selectors to under­
stand that administrators have a real com­
mitment to collection development. 

Supervisors should be aware that clear 
goals, objectives, and job descriptions cre­
ate a positive effect on an employee's mo­
rale and performance. Personnel litera­
ture is inconsistent about what causes job 
stress and dissatisfaction, but at least one 
library study suggests that role conflict 
(where expectations are in conflict) and 
role ambiguity (unclear expectations) ad­
versely affect job satisfaction. 14 



Unfortunately for those who must bal­
ance both reference and collection devel­
opment duties, helpful literature is 
sparse. There is considerable literature on 
time management, but it appears to focus 
primarily on how to keep one's desk clean 
and affords few hints on how to juggle 
two or more primary tasks. 

Much of the problem for part-time selec­
tors is showing how much time they de­
vote to collection development and the 
value of that investment. Reference work 
has a long history and an established im­
portance in librarianship, and it is some­
what easier to quantify than collection de­
velopment work. One can fairly easily put 
into figures the amount of time spent on 
the reference desk, running an online 
search, and talking to a class. Attempting 
to quantify collection development 
work-time spent consulting catalogs, re­
views, approval plans, talking to faculty 
and students, and examinin~ books on the 
shelves-is a difficult task. 1 This ignores 
times when one is doing both functions, 
e.g., going over approval slips or book re­
views while sitting at the reference desk. 
Often the problem is to convince people 
who have never done collection develop­
ment that such activities are worthwhile 
and essential for the library as a whole. 

Part of the problem may lie with those 
who do collection development. One of 
the oddities is that while almost everyone 
will admit it is a central mission of the li­
brary, many librarians and administrators 
seem to feel anyone can do it, it does not 
take much training or background, and 
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one does not really need to pay a lot of at­
tention to it. While it may be true that any­
one can do collection development, just as 
anyone can do cataloging, not everyone 
can do collection development well. Per­
haps those of us in collection development 
or management have not done enough to 
train selectors thoroughly in the tech­
niques of good collection development, 
evaluation, and management. Nor have 
we done enough to convince library ad­
ministrators that collection development 
is an important, time-consuming and not 
easily accomplished fact of librarianship. 16 

Particularly in the difficult financial cir­
cumstances that many libraries face, hav­
ing capable selectors doing good collec­
tion development is essential. The library 
needs to have a well-defined, rational, jus­
tifiable collection development policy, 
and everyone-selectors and nonselec­
tors, administrators and nonadministra­
tors-needs to be aware of and supportive 
of that policy. Selectors need to be well 
trained in the art of collection develop­
ment and in the needs and goals of the li­
brary and the parent institution. 

If selectors are also reference librarians, 
they need to feel that the time they devote 
to collection development is well spent 
and not time taken away from important 
reference activities. While striking a bal­
ance between collection development and 
reference duties is not an easy task, some 
compromise must be struck if we are to 
give part-time selectors the time and sup­
port they need to develop and manage 
good, coherent, well-planned collections. 
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